
101 STAT. 810 PUBLIC LAW 100-134—OCT. 16, 1987 

Public Law 100-134 
100th Congress 

An Act 

Oct. 16, 1987 To amend the Act establishing Lowell National Historical Park, and for other 
[H.R. 2035] purposes. 

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the 
United States of America in Congress assembled, 

SECTION 1. AMENDMENTS. 

The Act entitled "An Act to provide for the establishment of the 
Lowell National Historical Park in the Commonwealth of Massachu
setts, and for other purposes", approved June 5, 1978 (92 Stat. 290; 
16 U.S.C. 410cc et seq.), is amended— 

16 use 410CC-13. (1) in section 103(a)— 
(A) by striking "$18,500,000" and inserting "$19,800,000" 

in paragraph (1); and 
(B) by striking "$21,500,000" and inserting "$38,600,000" 

in paragraph (2); 
16 use 410CC-31. (2) in section 301(e)(2) by striking "for a period not longer than 

thirty days" and inserting "until his successor is appointed"; 
and 

(3) in section 301(i) by striking "ten" and inserting 
"seventeen". 

16 u s e 410CC-13 SEC. 2. EFFECTIVE DATES. 

(a) IN GENERAL.—Except as provided in subsection Ot>), the amend
ments made by section 1 shall take effect on the date of the 
enactment of this Act. 

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE OF AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATION.—The 
amendments made by section 1(1) shall take effect on October 1, 
1987. 

Approved October 16, 1987. 

LEGISLATIVE HISTORY—H.R. 2035 (S. 1012): 

HOUSE REPORTS: No. 100-303 (Comm. on Interior and Insular Affairs). 
CONGRESSIONAL RECORD, Vol. 133 (1987): 

Sept. 29, considered and passed House. 
Oct. 1, considered and passed Senate. 


